
27

13,192.630

21,117.080

41

$105.00

$22,440.00

$87,024.00

$19,798.50

$2,025.00

$60,791.00

Number of Parcels Offered:  

Number of Parcels Sold:  

Percentage of Parcels Sold:  

Number of Acres Offered:  

Number of Acres Sold:  

Percentage of Acres Sold:  

Average Bid Per Acre:  

High Bid Per Acre:  

High Bonus Bid:  

Total Bonus Bid:  

Total Rentals:  

Total Administrative Fees: 

Total Revenues:  

Total Paid at Sale:  

65.85 % 

62.47 % 

$6.60

$108,847.50

Bureau of Land Management 
California State Office  

Competitive Oil & Gas Lease Sale 
Summary of September 17, 2003 Sale 

9/17/03 

WESTERN STATES INTERNATIONAL 
168 HIGHLAND PLACE 
MONROVIA ,  CA 91016-      

High Bidder -  $105.00  / acre Bid  

WESTERN STATES INTERNATIONAL 
168 HIGHLAND PLACE 
MONROVIA ,  CA 91016-      

WEST COAST LAND SERVICE 
1230 CHESTER AVENUE 
BAKERSFIELD ,  CA 93301-      

High Bidder -  $22,440.00  Total Bonus  

WEST COAST LAND SERVICE 
1230 CHESTER AVENUE 
BAKERSFIELD ,  CA 93301-      



 

 

FUTURE INTEREST  PRESENT INTEREST  

COMPETITIVE ORAL AUCTION SUMMARY RESULTS  

California  State Office 
 

Sep 17, 2003 
 

1. Total Number of parcels offered:  

2. Total Number of acres offered:  

3. Total number of parcels receiving bids:  

4. Total number of acres receiving bids:  

5. Total sum of high bids for all parcels  

 receiving bids: 
 

6. Highest bonus amount of an individual  

 parcel (NOT per acre): 
 

7. Highest bonus amount - bid per acre:  

8. Received all monies due or at least the  

 minimum bonus bid due for all 
parcels 

 

 receiving bids on the day of the sale 
 

 (Yes) (No):  

 If no, explain: 

 9. Total number of sale parcels subject to  

 presale offers: 
 

10. Total number of acres subject to  

 presale offers: 
 

11. Number of presale offers sold  

 competitvely: 
 

12. Number of acres in presale offers  

 sold competitively: 
 

41

21,117.080 0.000

27 0

13,192.630 0.000

$87,024.00

$22,440.00

$105.00

0

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

0

0.000

0

0.000

YesYes
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California State Office 
Competitive Oil & Gas Lease Sale Results 

September 17, 2003 
 
 

Parcel No. Serial No. Bidder Name/Address Acres Bonus Per 
Acre 

Amount 

Total 
Bonus 

Advance 
Rental 

Admin Fee Total Revenue 

CA 9-03-1 CACA 45583 No bid       
CA 9-03-2 CACA 45584 West Coast Land Service 

1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

640.00 $3.00 $1,920.00 $960.00 $75.00 $2,955.00 

CA 9-03-3 CACA 45585 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

1,748.91 $2.00 $3,498.00 $2,623.50 $75.00 $6,196.50 

CA 9-03-4 CACA 45586 No bid       
CA 9-03-5 CACA 45587 West Coast Land Service 

1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

480.00 $4.00 $1,920.00 $720.00 $75.00 $2,715.00 

CA 9-03-6 CACA 45588 West Coast Land Service 
1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

573.27 $2.00 $1,148.00 $861.00 $75.00 $2,084.00 

CA 9-03-7 CACA 45589 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

160.00 $2.00 $320.00 $240.00 $75.00 $635.00 

CA 9-03-8 CACA 45590 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

222.07 $2.00 $446.00 $334.50 $75.00 $855.50 

CA 9-03-9 CACA 45591 West Coast Land Service 
1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

120.00 $4.00 $480.00 $180.00 $75.00 $735.00 

CA 9-03-10 CACA 45592 West Coast Land Service 
1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

643.57 $4.00 $2,576.00 $966.00 $75.00 $3,617.00 
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Parcel No. Serial No. Bidder Name/Address Acres Bonus Per 
Acre 

Amount 

Total 
Bonus 

Advance 
Rental 

Admin Fee Total Revenue 

CA 9-03-11 CACA 45593 West Coast Land Service 
1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

738.60 $3.50 $2,586.50 $1,108.50 $75.00 $3,770.00 

CA 9-03-12 CACA 45594 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

80.00 $2.00 $160.00 $120.00 $75.00 $355.00 

CA 9-03-13 CACA 45595 West Coast Land Service 
1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

333.60 $2.00 $668.00 $501.00 $75.00 $1,244.00 

CA 9-03-14 CACA 45596 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

411.89 $2.00 $824.00 $618.00 $75.00 $1,517.00 

CA 9-03-15 CACA 45597 No bid       
CA 9-03-16 CACA 45598 Mark Nahabedian 

214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

200.00 $2.00 $400.00 $300.00 $75.00 $775.00 

CA 9-03-17 CACA 45599 No bid       
CA 9-03-18 CACA 45600 No bid       
CA 9-03-19 CACA 45601 No bid       
CA 9-03-20 CACA 45602 Mark Nahabedian 

214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

1,212.68 $2.00 $2,426.00 $1,819.50 $75.00 $4,320.50 

CA 9-03-21 CACA 45603 No bid       
CA 9-03-22 CACA 45604 No bid       
CA 9-03-23 CACA 45605 No bid       
CA 9-03-24 CACA 45606 Maverick Petroleum Inc. 

1401 Commercial Way Ste 200 
Bakersfield, CA 93309 

227.07 $7.00 $1,596.00 $342.00 $75.00 $2,013.00 

CA 9-03-25 CACA 45607 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 
 
 

1,663.53 $2.00 $3,328.00 $2,496.00 $75.00 $5,899.00 
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Parcel No. Serial No. Bidder Name/Address Acres Bonus Per 
Acre 

Amount 

Total 
Bonus 

Advance 
Rental 

Admin Fee Total Revenue 

CA 9-03-26 CACA 45608 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

120.00 $2.00 $240.00 $180.00 $75.00 $495.00 

CA 9-03-27 CACA 45609 No bid       
CA 9-03-28 CACA 45610 Mark Nahabedian 

214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

360.00 $2.00 $720.00 $540.00 $75.00 $1,335.00 

CA 9-03-29 CACA 45611 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

280.00 $2.00 $560.00 $420.00 $75.00 $1,055.00 

CA 9-03-30 CACA 45612 No bid       
CA 9-03-31 CACA 45613 Hunter Dos Tres Corp 

5060 California Ave #640 
Bakersfield, CA 93309 

160.00 $67.50 $10,800.00 $240.00 $75.00 $11,115.00 

CA 9-03-32 CACA 45614 James B. Lynn 
1725 Park Place Dr 
Carmichael, CA 95608 

698.41 $2.50 $1,747.50 $1,048.50 $75.00 $2,871.00 

CA 9-03-33 CACA 45615 Hunter Dos Tres Corp 
5060 California Ave #640 
Bakersfield, CA 93309 

120.00 $7.00 $840.00 $180.00 $75.00 $1,095.00 

CA 9-03-34 CACA 45616 West Coast Land Service 
1230 Chester Ave 
Bakersfield, CA 93301 

680.00 $33.00 $22,440.00 $1,020.00 $75.00 $23,535.00 

CA 9-03-35 CACA 45617 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

480.00 $2.00 $960.00 $720.00 $75.00 $1,755.00 

CA 9-03-36 CACA 45618 Western States International 
168 Highland Place 
Monrovia, CA  91016 

160.00 $105.00 $16,800.00 $240.00 $75.00 $17,115.00 

CA 9-03-37 CACA 45619 Western States International 
168 Highland Place 
Monrovia, CA  91016 

279.03 $11.50 $3,220 $420.00 $75.00 $3,715.00 

CA 9-03-38 CACA 45620 No bid       
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Parcel No. Serial No. Bidder Name/Address Acres Bonus Per 
Acre 

Amount 

Total 
Bonus 

Advance 
Rental 

Admin Fee Total Revenue 

CA 9-03-39 CACA 45621 Mark Nahabedian 
214 West Aliso St 
Ojai, CA 93023 

400.00 $11.00 $4,400.00 $600.00 $75.00 $5,075.00 

CA 9-03-40 CACA 45622 No bid       
CA 9-03-41 CACA 45623 No bid       

  


